O©oOoO~NOoO Ok WN P

17
18
19

| 20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46

CITY OF LITTLETON, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. 22

Series, 2024

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LITTLETON,
COLORADO, AMENDING SECTIONS OF TITLE A4,
BUILDING REGULATIONS, OF THE CITY CODE

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF LITTLETON, COLORADO, THAT:

Section 1: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

A

B.

International Building Code, 2021 edition, of the International Code
Council.

International Residential Code, 2021 edition of, 2" printing, the
International Code Council.

International Mechanical Code, 2021 edition, of the International Code
Council.

National Electric Code, 2023 edition, of the National Fire Protection
Association.

International Plumbing Code, 2021 edition, of the International Code
Council.

International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 edition, of the International Code
Council.

International Property Maintenance Code, 2021 edition, of the International
Code Council.

International Energy Conservation Code, 2021 edition, of the International
Code Council.

International Existing Building Code, 2021 edition, of the International
Code Council.

International Fire Code, 2021 edition, of the International Code Council.
Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 edition, of
the International Conference of Building Officials.

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2021 edition, of the

M.

International Code Council.
ICC A117.1 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities, 2017 edition,

of the International Code Council.

Section 2: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-5 is hereby amended to read as follows:



47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54

| 55

89

58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66

68
69
70
| 71
72
73
| 74
75
76
77
78
79
80

82
83
| 84
85
86
87
88
| 89
90

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 2

Administrative provisions in Section 4-1-5(A) shall apply to permits issued for work related to
grading, excavation, floodplain or rights-of way under the jurisdiction of the City of Littleton. The
amendments contained within Section 4-1-5 (B) through (J4) shall apply to those codes adopted in
Section 4-1-1 of this Title.

Section 2: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-5.A.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3. Duties and Powers of City EngineerOfficials

a. [Reserved]General—TheCityEngineer—or—designee—is—authorized—to
= . : | 1
enlelee_ all, Eltlne pll OVISIORS I % fl"s chapte: .as H—felates—to—grading

b. Applications and Permits: The City Engineer, Chief Building Official, or
designee shall receive applications, review construction documents and
issue permits for work related to grading, excavation, floodplain or rights-
of way and is authorized to inspect the work for which such permits have
been issued and enforce compliance with the provisions of applicable
code.

c. Inspections: The City Engineer—ortheir—appointed-representative—shall
make all of the required inspections. Reports of such inspections shall
be in writing and be certified by a responsible officer of such approved
agency or by the responsible individual.

The City Engineer-is authorized to engage such expert opinion as deemed
necessary to report upon unusual technical issues that arise, subject to the
approval of the appointing authority.

d. Department Records: The City Engineer—shall keep official records of
permits, and fees collected, reports of inspections and notices and orders
issued. Such records shall be retained in official records for the period
required for retention of public records.

e. Stop Work Orders: Whenever any work is being done in violation of the
provisions of the applicable code or other ordinances implemented
through the enforcement of the applicable code or in a dangerous or unsafe
manner, the City Engineermay order the work stopped by issuing a notice
in writing and serving it upon any persons engaged in doing such work or
causing such work to be done. Upon receipt of the notice, such persons
shall stop work until authorized by the City Engineerto proceed with the
work. It is unlawful to continue any work after receipt of a notice to stop
work except such work as directed to remove a violation or unsafe
condition. Each day that work is continued after receipt of a notice shall
constitute a separate violation of this code.

f. Enforcement of adopted Building Codes: The City Engineershall enforce
provisions contained within Sections 104.10.1, 1612.3, 1612.4, 1804.5,
and Chapter 32, Appendix G, and Appendix J of the IBC as hereby



https://online.encodeplus.com/regs/littleton-co-cc/doc-view.aspx?pn=0&ajax=0&secid=233
https://online.encodeplus.com/regs/littleton-co-cc/doc-view.aspx?pn=0&ajax=0&secid=214
https://online.encodeplus.com/regs/littleton-co-cc/doc-view.aspx?pn=0&ajax=0&secid=201
https://online.encodeplus.com/regs/littleton-co-cc/doc-view.aspx?pn=0&ajax=0&secid=216

91
92

93

94

95

96

97

98

99
100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110
111
112
113
114
115
116
117
118
119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126
127
128
129
130
131
132
133
134
135

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024

Page 3

adopted and as amended in 4-1-5(B), and R104.10.1 and R106.1.4 of the
IRC.

Section 3: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building Codes,
Section 4-1-5.B.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety and reserved:

5.

[Reserved]




136
137
138
139
140
141
142
143
144
145
146
147
h48
149
150
151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
h63
164
165
166
ﬁ(s?

68
169
170
171
h72
173
h74
175
76
177
E?S

79

180

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 4




Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 5

htSl
82
183
84
185
ﬁse
87
188
ttsg
90
191
h92
193
194
195
196
197
198
199
200
201
202
203
204 Section 3: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building Codes,
205  Section 4-1-5.B.6 is hereby amended as follows:
206
207 6. Section [A] 105.5 Expiration is hereby amended to read as follows:
208 [A]105.5 Expiration.
209
210 Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by
211 such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work
212 authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180

ElS days after the time that the Work has commenced —aad—shat#e*p#e—ﬁ’;@&day&a-fter

14 3 ;
15 Bwtdmg—@#leraL The burldrng off|C|aI is authorlzed to grant in ertlng, one or
216 more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension
217 shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

218

219 Section 3: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building Codes,
220  Section 4-1-5.B.9 is hereby amended as follows:

221

222 9. Section [A]109.3 Permit valuations, is hereby amended to read as follows:

223 [A]109.3 Permit valuations.

224

225 The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at time of




Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024

Page 6
E26 application. Permit valuations shall reflect the total value of all work;—inchuding

27 materials-and-tabor; for which the permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas,

228 mechanical, plumbing equipment, permanent systems and all finish work. If, in the
229 opinion of the building official, the valuation is underestimated on the application,
230 the permit shall be denied, unless the applicant can show detailed estimates to meet
231 the approval of the building official. Final building permit valuation shall be set by
232 the building official.
233
234 Section 3: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building Codes,

235  Section 4-1-5.B.12 is hereby deleted in its entirety and reserved:

235
b33 12. [Reserved]

. iorwallline.
¢ clones§ : ical
s horizontal (2:12), : ceal
its horizontal (4:12). | -

Asphalt 15072 %W@WMMMWM




Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 7




Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 8

239

240
241 Section 5: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building Codes,
242  4-1-5.C.2is hereby deleted in its entirety and reserved:



Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 9

2. [Reserved]
folows:




88
89
90

291
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99
00
01
02
03
04
05
06
07
08
09
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

323
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 10




33
34
35

336
337

338

339
340

341
342

43
44
45

346
347
348
B49
350
351
352
353
354
355
356
B57
358
359
360
361
Eez

63
364
365
366
367
B68
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 11

Section 6: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-5.C.3 is hereby amended as follows:

3. Section R105.5 Expiration, is hereby amended to read as follows:
R105.5 Expiration.

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the
site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time that

the work has commenced;.-and-shal-expire-365-days-afterissuanceregardiess-of-activity;
unless an extension of the permit is granted by the Building Official. The building official

is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not more than
180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated.

Section 7: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-5.C.4 is hereby amended as follows:

4. Section R108.3 Building permit valuations, is hereby amended to read as follows:
R108.3 Building permit valuations.

The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at time of application.
Permit valuations shall reflect the total value of all work; including-materials-and-laber-for
which the permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing equipment,
permanent systems and all finish work. If, in the opinion of the building official, the
valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied, unless the
applicant can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the building official. Final
building permit valuation shall be set by the building official.

Section 7: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-5.C.7, Table R301.2 is hereby deleted and replaced in its entirety with the
following:

7. Table R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria is hereby amended to read as
follows:
R301.2 Climatic and geographic design criteria.

Buildings shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of this code as limited
by the provisions of this section. Additional criteria shall be established by the local
jurisdiction and set forth in Table R301.2



Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024
Page 12
377
TABLE R301.2
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
GROUND SEISMIC FROM BARRIER | o 000 AIR MEAN
SNOW special Wind- DESIGN Frost UNDER- RDS FREEZING | ANNUAL
graphic  wind kol CATEGORY' [ialll "*NP WY LAYMENT ”"‘ZA INDEX | TEMP
_ ing depth? REQUIRED
zone
ligh o
non-reducible| 136 mph severe gt Yes Footnote A 532 50.2° F
MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA"
Altitude Indoor winter ) )
Elevation cormmection Coincident design dry- Indoor winter design Outdoor winter design Heating temperature
wet bulb bulb dry-bulb temperature dry-bulb temperature difference
factor temperature
9374 0.82 59° F 59° F 70°F 1°F 69° F
Indoor
summer . )
Latitude Daily design Summer Indoor summer design dry- Outdoor summer design dry- Cooling temperature
range relative design gains bulb temperature bulb temperature difference
humidity
35.3952° H 45% 45% 70° F 90° F 20°F
For SI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.
378 A. Entered National Flood Insurance Program 1978; Flood Insurance Study for Arapahoe County and Incorporated Areas - September 4, 2020
379 Section 7: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

380  Codes, Sections 4-1-5.C.8 through 4-1-5.C.15 are hereby amended as follows:
381

82 8. ,
83 enmety— Sectlon R31O 5 Replacement wmdows for emerqency escape and recue
84 openings, is hereby amended to read as follows:

385

ESG Replacement windows for emergency escape and recue openings shall comply with the
87 requirements for new construction.

388

389
90 9. SesbeonBole L Deenn apeee ollebon e bepebe daledec n e apbele Bec|on
91 R310.7 Alterations or repairs of existing basements, is hereby amended to read as
92 follows:

393
94 Existing basements undergoing alterations or repairs and that are to contain habitable
95 spaces shall have at least one emergency escape and rescue opening that complies with
96 the requirements for new construction. Each new, altered, or repaired sleeping room
97 within a basement shall have at least one emergency escape and rescue opening that
98 complies with the requirements for new construction.

399

400 10. Section R310.7.1 Existing emergency escape and rescue openings, is hereby deleted

A01 in its entlrety M%MMW&%M@&WWW

102

A03

404

A05




ko7
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416
417
418
419
420
421
122
423
124
425
426
427
428
429
430
431
432
433
434
435
436
437
438
439
440
441
142
443
A44
A45
446
147
A48
449
450
451

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024

Page 13

Section 313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic sprinkler systems is hereby
amended to read as follows:
R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic sprinkler systems.

An automatic sprinkler system may be installed in one- and two-family dwellings.
Exception: An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required for additions or
alterations to existing buildings that are not already provided with a sprinkler system.

Section 313.2.1 Design and installation, is hereby amended to read as follows:
R313.2.1 Design and installation.

Automatic sprinkler systems, when installed, shall be designed and installed in
accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D.




Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 14

452

153 14, [Reserved]Section—324-6-21-Alternative-—sethack—atridge—s—hereby-deleted—in—its

154 ootons
455

156 15. Reserved. R9
57  follows:
158 e




Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 15




Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 16

459

460 Section 15: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
461  Codes, Section 4-1-5.C.32 is hereby deleted in its entirety:

462

463

.264
65

466
467 Section 15: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
468  Codes, Section 4-1-5.C.33 is hereby deleted in its entirety:

69
.270
471
472 Section 15: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
473  Codes, Section 4-1-5.D.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety and reserved:

474

A75 5. [Reserved]

A76  folows:
AT7
478
A79
A80
181
A82
A83
A84
A85
A86
A87
A88
A89
490
A91
192
A93
A94




Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024
Page 17
.295

96
497

98

99

00

01
502
503 Section 15: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
504  Codes, Section 4-1-5.D.6 is hereby amended as follows:

505

506 Section [A]106.5.3 Expiration, is hereby amended to read as follows:

507 [A]106.5.3 Expiration.

508 Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by
509 such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work
510 authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180
Ell days after the time that the Work IS commenced —and—sha”—e*p#e%@&&ayse#er

12 : .

13 BeHdmg—Q#leral—The burldrng off|C|aI is authorlzed to grant in ertlng, one or
514 more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension
515 shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

516

517 Section 16: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
518 Codes, Section 4-1-5.D.8 is hereby amended as follows:

519

520 Section [A]109.3 Permit valuations, is hereby amended to read as follows:

521 [A]109.3 Permit valuations.

522

523 The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at time of
E24 application. Permit valuations shall reflect the total value of all work; including

25 materials—and-laber,—for which the permit is being issued, such as mechanical
526 equipment, permanent systems and all finish work. If, in the opinion of the code
527 official, the valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be
528 denied unless the applicant can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the
529 code official. Final building permit valuation shall be set by the code official.

530

531 Section 16: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
532  Codes, Section 4-1-5.D.11 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

533

E34

35
536
537 Section 17: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

538  Codes, Section 4-1-5.E.5 is hereby amended as follows:
539



540
541
542
543
544
545

46
47
48

549
550
551
552
553
554
555
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
563
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
572
573
574
575
76
77
78
79
80
581
582
583
584

Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024
Page 18

Section [A]106.5.3 Expiration, is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A] 106.5.3 Expiration.

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by
such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work
authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180

days after the tlme that the Work is commenced —and—sta“—e*ptre%@&elaysaﬁer

Berrtdmg—@#ﬁeraL The bU|Id|ng off|C|aI is authorlzed to grant in ertlng, one or
more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension
shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Section 18: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Sections 4-1-5.E.11 is hereby amended as follows:

Section 410.4 Substitution, is hereby amended to read as follows:

410.4 Substitution.

Where restaurants provide drinking water free of charge, drinking fountains shall
not be required in those restaurants. In other occupancies where drinking fountains
are required, water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for the non-
accessible drinking fountain, but not more than 50 percent of all required drinking
fountains when 3 or more are required.

Section 18: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Sections 4-1-5.E.12 is hereby added as follows:

Section 903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected, is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected.
Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated not less than twelve
(12) inches (304 mm) above the roof.

Section 19: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.F.5 is hereby amended as follows:



585
586
587
588
589
590

91
92
93

594
E95

96
597

598
599

00
01
02

603
604
605
606
607
608
609
610
611
612
613
614
615
616
617
618
619
20
621
622
623
624
625
626
627
628
629

Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024

Page

19

5. Section [A]106.5.3 Expiration, is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A] 106.5.3 Expiration.

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by
such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work
authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180

days after the tlme that the Work IS commenced —aaei—sha“—e*prre%@&elayseﬂer

Baumhg—gﬁleraL The burldrng off|C|aI is authorlzed to grant in ertlng, one or
more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension
shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Section 20: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.F.13 is hereby deleted in its entirety:

| ¢ C_IFGS)_Exi irols of Mochapical Draft_ancDi

Section 20: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.H.8 is hereby amended as follows:

8. Section 602.3 Heat supply, is hereby amended to read as follows:
602.3 Heat supply.

Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or more
dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish
heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat to maintain a minimum temperature
of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms.

Exceptions:

1. When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature
for the locality, maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be
required provided that the heating system is operating at its full design capacity.
The winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as indicated in

Appendix-D-of the-International Plumbing-Code . Table R301.2.

2. In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30°F (-1°C), a
minimum temperature of 65°F (18°C) shall be maintained.

Section 21: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.1.5 is hereby amended as follows:



630
631
632
b33
634
35
36
37
38
639
640
641
642
643
644
645
646
647
648
E49
50
651
652
653
654
655
656
657
658
659
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74

Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024
Page 20

5.Section [A]105.5 Expiration, is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A]105.5. Expiration.

Every permit issued shall expire—365-days—afterthe date—ofissuance—and-shal

become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized on site by such permit
is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time that the work -has
commanced —ertessan-exdepsiop-othepermi-sgranted-by-hecodeoFeinl The
eede-building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of
time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in
writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Section 21: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.1.6 is hereby amended as follows:

6. Section [A]108.3 Permit valuations, is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A]108.3 Permit valuations.

The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at time of
application. Permit valuations shall include the total value of all work -including
materials-and-tabor—for which the permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas,
mechanical, plumbing equipment and permanent systems and all finish work. If, in
the opinion of the code official, the valuation is underestimated on the application,
the permit shall be denied unless the applicant can show detailed estimates to meet
the approval of the code official. Final building permit valuation shall be set by the
code official.

Section 22: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.1.8 is hereby amended as follows:




E?S
76
677
78
79
80
81
82
83
684
685
686
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95

97
98
99
00
01
02
03
04
05
706
707
708
709
710
711
712
713
714
715
716
717
718
719

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024

Page 21

Section 505.3 Replacement windows for emergency escape and rescue openings, is

hereby amended to read as follows:

Replacement windows for emergency escape and rescue openings shall comply
with the requirements for new construction.

Section 22: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.1.9 is hereby amended as follows:

I .y icting | ¢ asnbalt shingl

Section 702.5 Replacement window for emergency escape and rescue openings, is

hereby amended to read as follows:

Where windows are required to provide emergency escape and rescue openings in
Group R-2 and R-3 occupancies and one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses,
such openings shall comply with the requirements for new construction.

Section 23: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.1.10 is hereby amended as follows:

Section [BS]705.2.1.1 Exceptions, is hereby amended to read as follows.

[BS]705.2.1.1 Exceptions.




720
721
722
723
724
725
726
727
728
729
730
731
732
733
734
735
736
737
738
739
740
741
742
743
744
745
746
747
748
749
750
751
752
753
754
755
756
757
758
759
760
761
762
763
764

Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024
Page 22

A roof recover shall not be permitted where any of the following conditions occur:
1. The existing roof or roof covering is water soaked or has deteriorated to the point
that the existing roof or roof covering is not adequate as a base for additional
roofing.

2. The existing roof covering is slate, clay, cement or asbestos-cement tile.

3. The existing roof has two or more applications of any type of roof covering.

4. The roof has one or more existing layers of asphalt shingles.

Section 23: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building

Codes, Section 4-1-5.1.11 is hereby amended as follows:

Section 1001.4 Permit required, is hereby added to read as follows:
1001.4 Permit required.

Any owner or owner’s authorized agent who intends to change the occupancy of a
building or structure or to cause any work to be performed that will change the
occupancy group or classification of a building or structure, shall first make
application to the building official and obtain the required permit.

Section 24: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building Codes,
Section 4-1-5.J is hereby added as follows:

J. Amendments to the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code: The 2021

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is hereby adopted by reference and amended as

follows:

1. Section [A]101.1 Title, is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A]101.1 Title.
These provisions shall be known as the Swimming Pool and Spa Code of City
of Littleton, Colorado, and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein
as “this code.”

2. Section [A]103.1 Creation of agency, is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A]103.1 Creation of agency.
The City of Littleton Building Division is hereby deemed the agency in charge
of enforcement of this code and the official in charge thereof shall be known as
the code official. The function of the agency shall be the implementation,
administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

3. Section [A]106.1 Construction Documents, is hereby deleted in its entirety.




765
766
767
768
769
770
771
772
773
774
775
776
77
778
779
780
781
782
783
784
785
786
787
788
789
790
791
792
793
794
95
96
97
98
99
00
01
02
03
04
05
06
07
08
09

Ordinance No. 22

Section [A]106.1.2 Retention of construction documents, is hereby deleted in

its entirety.

Section [A]106.5.3 Expiration, is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 105.4.3 Expiration.

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work
authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of
180 days after the time that the work has commenced. The building official is
authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not
more than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and
justifiable cause demonstrated.

Section [A]105.4.4 Extensions, is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Series, 2024
Page 23
4.
5.
6.
7.

Section 305.1 General, is hereby amended to read as follows:

The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers for restricting
entry into areas having pools and spas. Where residential spas or hot tubs are
equipped with a lockable safety cover complying with ASTM F1346 and
residential swimming pools are equipped with a powered safety cover that
complies with ASTM F1346, the areas where those residential spas, hot tubs or
pools are located shall not be required to comply with Sections 305.2 through
305.7.

Section 25: Littleton City Code, Title 4, Building Regulations, Chapter 1, Building
Codes, Section 4-1-10 is hereby deleted in its entirety and reserved:



https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ISPSC2021P3_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdF1346_1991_2018/3042
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ISPSC2021P3_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdF1346_1991_2018/3042
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ISPSC2021P3_Ch03_Sec305.2/3042
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ISPSC2021P3_Ch03_Sec305.7/3042

835

836

837

838

839

840

841

842

843

Ordinance No. 22
Series, 2024
Page 24

Section 26:  Severability. If any part, section, subsection, sentence, clause or
phrase of this ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the
validity of the remaining sections of this ordinance. The City Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, including each part, section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
hereof, irrespective of the fact that one or more parts, sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or
phrases may be declared invalid.

Section 27:  Repealer. All ordinances or resolutions, or parts thereof, in conflict
with this ordinance are hereby repealed, provided that this repealer shall not repeal the repealer
clauses of such ordinance nor revive any ordinance thereby.

INTRODUCED AS A BILL at a regularly scheduled meeting of the City Council
of the City of Littleton on the 15" day of October, 2024, passed on first reading by a vote of _6
FOR and _0 AGAINST,; and ordered published by posting at Littleton Center, Bemis Library,
the Municipal Courthouse and on the City of Littleton Website.

PUBLIC HEARING on the Ordinance to take place on the 19" day of November,

2024, in the Council Chamber, Littleton Center, 2255 West Berry Avenue, Littleton, Colorado, at

the hour of 6:30 p.m., or as soon thereafter as it may be heard.

PASSED on second and final reading, following public hearing, by avote of __ FOR and
____ AGAINST on the 19" day of November, 2024 and ordered published by posting at Littleton

Center, Bemis Library, the Municipal Courthouse and on the City of Littleton Website.



Ordinance No. 22

Series, 2024
Page 25
844  ATTEST:
845
846  Colleen L. Norton Kyle Schlachter
847 CITY CLERK MAYOR
848
849  APPROVED AS TO FORM:
850
851

852  Reid Betzing
853 CITY ATTORNEY




